
The War of Return: Unraveling History's
Greatest Conflict

The War of Return, an epic conflict that has shaped the course of history, is a
topic of great significance. It delves deep into human emotions of redemption,
revenge, and the yearning for a homeland. This article aims to provide a
comprehensive understanding of this immense war, tracing its roots, highlighting
key events, and capturing the hearts and minds of those involved.

Origin and Background

The War of Return primarily emerges from the complex history surrounding the
Israeli-Palestinian conflict. At its core, it represents the battle between the Jews
and Palestinians for their respective rights to return to ancestral lands. Both sides
strongly believe in their historical, religious, and cultural connections to the
region, leading to an irreconcilable clash of ideologies.
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The origins of this conflict can be traced back to the late 19th century, when the
Zionist movement sought to establish a Jewish homeland in Palestine. However,
this ambition clashed with the aspirations of the Arab residents, resulting in
decades of tension, violence, and territorial disputes.

Key Events and Turning Points

The War of Return witnessed several significant events that intensified the
conflict. One such event is the Nakba, meaning "catastrophe" in Arabic, which
signifies the displacement of hundreds of thousands of Palestinians during the
1948 Arab-Israeli War. The Nakba remains a deeply influential event, fueling
Palestinian grievances and shaping their struggle for a right of return.

Another turning point was the 1967 Six-Day War, during which Israel captured
East Jerusalem, the West Bank, and the Gaza Strip. This conquest further
complicated the dynamics, leading to prolonged occupation and generating
dissent and resistance among Palestinians.
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In recent years, the issue of settlements has emerged as a flashpoint. Israeli
settlements in the occupied territories have been a major obstacle to peace
negotiations, as Palestinians argue that these encroachments undermine their
hopes for an independent state.

Unresolved Questions and Ongoing Struggles

The War of Return raises several unresolved questions that continue to fuel
tensions today. One of the most pressing questions is whether Palestinians have
the right to return to their ancestral homes as mandated by UN Resolution 194.
This demand clashes with Israel's demographic concerns and fears of losing a
Jewish majority.

The issue of Jerusalem remains a contentious topic, with both Israelis and
Palestinians claiming it as their rightful capital. The status of holy sites, such as
the Al-Aqsa Mosque and the Western Wall, adds religious dimensions, making it
a highly emotional and complex issue.

The Path to Peace

Achieving peace in the War of Return has been elusive, but progress has been
made through diplomatic efforts. The Oslo Accords of the 1990s aimed to resolve
the conflict through a two-state solution. However, implementation challenges,
sporadic violence, and political gridlock have hindered lasting peace.

Negotiations and initiatives, such as the Camp David Summit and the Arab Peace
Initiative, have provided glimpses of hope, but a comprehensive resolution
remains elusive. Ultimately, genuine dialogue, mutual recognition, and
concessions from both sides will be essential to break the cycle of violence and
resentment.



The War of Return is a deeply rooted conflict driven by historical, religious, and
cultural narratives. It is a battle for identity, justice, and the fulfillment of long-
standing aspirations. As the world grapples with this complex issue,
understanding its roots, acknowledging its human consequences, and supporting
meaningful dialogue become crucial steps towards an enduring solution.
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Two prominent Israeli liberals argue that for the conflict between Israel and the
Palestinians to end with peace, Palestinians must come to terms with the fact that
there will be no "right of return."

In 1948, seven hundred thousand Palestinians were forced out of their homes by
the first Arab-Israeli War. More than seventy years later, most of their houses are
long gone, but millions of their descendants are still registered as refugees, with
many living in refugee camps. This group—unlike countless others that were
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displaced in the aftermath of World War II and other conflicts—has remained
unsettled, demanding to settle in the state of Israel. Their belief in a "right of
return" is one of the largest obstacles to successful diplomacy and lasting peace
in the region.

In The War of Return, Adi Schwartz and Einat Wilf—both liberal Israelis
supportive of a two-state solution—reveal the origins of the idea of a right of
return, and explain how UNRWA - the very agency charged with finding a solution
for the refugees - gave in to Palestinian, Arab and international political pressure
to create a permanent “refugee” problem. They argue that this Palestinian
demand for a “right of return” has no legal or moral basis and make an
impassioned plea for the US, the UN, and the EU to recognize this fact, for the
good of Israelis and Palestinians alike.

A runaway bestseller in Israel, the first English translation of The War of Return is
certain to spark lively debate throughout America and abroad.
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