
The Pure Theory of Law: Understanding Hans
Kelsen's Legal Philosophy
In the field of legal philosophy, few figures have had as profound an impact as
Hans Kelsen. His work on the Pure Theory of Law revolutionized the way law is
understood and analyzed. Kelsen's theories provide a comprehensive framework
for understanding the nature of law and its relationship to society.

The Life and Background of Hans Kelsen

Hans Kelsen was born on October 11, 1881, in Prague, which was then part of
the Austro-Hungarian Empire. He studied law at the University of Vienna and later
became a professor at the same institution. Kelsen's early works focused on
public law and legal theory, but it was his magnum opus, "Pure Theory of Law,"
that solidified his reputation as one of the most influential legal philosophers of
the 20th century.

The Essence of the Pure Theory of Law

The Pure Theory of Law, as articulated by Kelsen, seeks to provide a systematic
approach to legal interpretation and understanding. At its core, this theory
emphasizes the autonomy of law and aims to separate legal norms from moral
and political considerations. According to Kelsen, laws should be analyzed and
interpreted solely based on their internal logical consistency and formal validity.
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Kelsen's theory rejects the traditional positivist approach, which suggests that law
derives its validity from higher moral or divine principles. Instead, he argues that
legal norms derive their legitimacy from within the legal system itself. This
perspective allows for a more objective understanding of law and ensures that
legal analysis does not become subjective or biased.

The Pure Theory of Law and Legal Validity

Central to the Pure Theory of Law is the concept of legal validity. Kelsen posits
that the validity of a legal norm depends on its position within the hierarchical
structure of a legal system. The validity of a legal norm is not contingent on its
content or substance, but rather on its conformity to superior norms and the
procedural rules of the legal system.

This hierarchical structure allows for the identification of the Grundnorm, or basic
norm, which serves as the fundamental source of validity for an entire legal order.
The Grundnorm is not derived from any external authority but is a hypothetical
construct necessary for the coherence and functioning of the legal system. It is
the highest norm that cannot be justified by a superior norm.

Criticism and Influence of Kelsen's Pure Theory of Law
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While Kelsen's Pure Theory of Law received widespread recognition and shaped
legal philosophy in the 20th century, it also faced its fair share of criticism. One
major critique was the accusation of formalism, suggesting that Kelsen's theory
focused too much on the form of law rather than its substantive content.

Nevertheless, Kelsen's contributions to legal philosophy cannot be denied. His
ideas influenced generations of legal scholars and continue to shape
contemporary legal thought. Many scholars have built upon Kelsen's theories,
further refining and expanding his ideas to address the evolving complexities of
the legal world.

In

Hans Kelsen's Pure Theory of Law has undeniably made a lasting impact on the
field of legal philosophy. His systematic approach to legal interpretation and the
emphasis on the autonomy of law has provided scholars with a valuable
framework for understanding the nature of law. While the theory has faced
criticism, its influence cannot be understated.

Today, legal scholars continue to delve into Kelsen's work and build upon his
ideas, ensuring that the Pure Theory of Law remains a relevant and vibrant
intellectual tradition.
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A landmark in the development of modern jurisprudence. Reprint of second
revised and enlarged edition, a complete revision of the first edition published in
1934. Translation from the Second German Edition by Max Knight. Originally
published: Berkeley: University of California Press, 1967. x, 356 pp. Pure Theory
of Law defines law as a system of coercive norms created by the state that rests
on the validity of a generally accepted Grundnorm, or basic norm, such as the
supremacy of the Constitution. Entirely self-supporting, it rejects any concept
derived from metaphysics, politics, ethics, sociology, or the natural sciences.
Beginning with the medieval reception of Roman law, traditional jurisprudence
has maintained a dual system of “subjective” law (the rights of a person) and
“objective” law (the system of norms). Throughout history this dualism has been a
useful tool for putting the law in the service of politics, especially by rulers or
dominant political parties. The pure theory of law destroys this dualism by
replacing it with a unitary system of objective positive law that is insulated from
political manipulation.

Possibly the most influential jurisprudent of the twentieth century, HANS KELSEN
[1881-1973] was legal adviser to Austria’s last emperor and its first republican
government, the founder and permanent advisor of the Supreme Constitutional
Court of Austria, and the author of Austria’s Constitution, which was enacted in
1920, abolished during the Anschluss, and restored in 1945. The author of more
than forty books on law and legal philosophy, he is best known for this work and
General Theory of Law and State. Also active as a teacher in Europe and the
United States, he was Dean of the Law Faculty of the University of Vienna and
taught at the universities of Cologne and Prague, the Institute of International
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Studies in Geneva, Harvard, Wellesley, the University of California at Berkeley,
and the Naval War College.
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