
How Bill Barr Broke The Prosecutor Code And
Corrupted The Justice Department
When it comes to upholding the principles of justice and maintaining the integrity
of the legal system, a prosecutor's role is crucial. The prosecutor's code of ethics
requires them to act independently, fairly, and in the best interest of justice.
However, during William Barr's tenure as the United States Attorney General,
serious concerns arose regarding his commitment to these principles.

The Role of the Justice Department

The United States Department of Justice (DOJ) is responsible for ensuring the
fair and impartial administration of justice. It serves as the guardian of the rule of
law, safeguarding the rights of individuals and ensuring equal treatment under the
law. The DOJ is divided into various divisions, including the Office of the Attorney
General led by the Attorney General, who oversees its operations.

Bill Barr's Appointment and the Prosecutor's Code

Bill Barr's appointment as the Attorney General raised concerns among legal
experts and critics. Throughout his tenure, Barr's actions appeared to deviate
from the prosecutor's code, compromising the independence of the DOJ and
eroding public trust in the system.
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1. Politicizing the DOJ

One of the most significant ways Barr broke the prosecutor code was by
politicizing the DOJ. Rather than upholding the principle of impartiality, Barr
consistently displayed a bias towards protecting and advancing the interests of
the Trump administration. This was evident in his handling of high-profile cases,
such as the Mueller investigation and the prosecution of political allies.

2. Undermining Independent Investigations

Barr's intervention in the Mueller investigation raised questions about his
commitment to allowing independent investigations to run their course. His
mischaracterization of the investigation's findings and premature led many to
question his motives and whether he was faithfully upholding the prosecutor's
code.

3. Interfering in Prosecutorial Decisions

Another aspect of the prosecutor code that Barr violated was interfering in
prosecutorial decisions to protect the interests of the Trump administration. The
controversial cases involving Michael Flynn and Roger Stone highlighted

FREE

http://dl.neutronbyte.com/pdf-file/Wa18oYTP/e/wjkK/OPMw/Palvy/Hatchet-Man-How-Bill-Barr-Broke-the-Prosecutors-Code-and-Corrupted-the-Justice-Department.pdf
http://dl.neutronbyte.com/pdf-file/Wa18oYTP/e/wjkK/OPMw/Palvy/Hatchet-Man-How-Bill-Barr-Broke-the-Prosecutors-Code-and-Corrupted-the-Justice-Department.pdf


instances where Barr's interventions seemingly favored political allies, raising
concerns about equal justice and the independence of the DOJ.

4. Diminishing Public Trust

The erosion of public trust in the justice system is a serious consequence of any
breach of the prosecutor's code. Barr's actions and behavior as the Attorney
General contributed to a significant loss of public confidence in the DOJ's ability
to function independently and as an impartial arbiter of justice.

It is essential to hold the Attorney General accountable for upholding the
prosecutor's code and ensuring the independence of the Justice Department. The
actions and decisions made by William Barr during his tenure raise critical
questions about his commitment to these principles. Restoring public trust and
the rule of law requires undertaking comprehensive reforms and selecting
individuals who prioritize justice over political interests in key positions within the
DOJ.
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NATIONAL BESTSELLER

“Elie Honig has written much more than a compelling takedown of an unfit
attorney general; he also offers a blueprint for how impartial and apolitical justice
should be administered in America.”—Preet Bharara

“An essential analysis for anyone committed to understanding the abuses of the
Trump administration so we can ensure they never happen again.”—Joyce White
Vance

“Essential reading for all who cherish the rule of law in America.”—George
Conway

"Written with all the color and pacing of a legal thriller."—Variety

CNN Senior Legal Analyst Elie Honig exposes William Barr as the most corrupt
attorney general in modern U.S. history, with stunning new scandals bubbling to
the surface even after Barr's departure from office.  

In Hatchet Man, former federal prosecutor Elie Honig uncovers Barr’s
unprecedented abuse of power as Attorney General and the lasting structural
damage done to the Justice Department. Honig uses his own experience as a
prosecutor at DOJ to show how, as America’s top law enforcement official, Barr
repeatedly violated the Department’s written rules, and those vital, unwritten
norms and principles that comprise the “prosecutor’s code.”

Barr was corrupt from the beginning. His first act as AG was to distort the findings
of Special Counsel Robert Mueller, earning a public rebuke for his dishonesty
from Mueller himself and, later, from a federal judge. Then, Barr tried to
manipulate the law to squash a whistleblower’s complaint about Trump’s dealings



with Ukraine—the report that eventually led to Trump’s first impeachment. Barr
later intervened in an unprecedented manner to undermine his own DOJ
prosecutors on the cases of Michael Flynn and Roger Stone, both political allies
of the President. And then Barr fired the U.S. Attorney for the Southern District of
New York under false pretenses. Finally, Barr amplified baseless theories about
massive mail-in ballot fraud, pouring gasoline on the dumpster fire battle over the
2020 election results and contributing to the January 6 insurrection that led to
Trump’s second impeachment.

In Hatchet Man, Honig proves that Barr trampled the two core virtues that have
long defined the department and its mission: credibility and independence –
ultimately in service of his own deeply-rooted, extremist legal and personal
beliefs. Honig shows how Barr corrupted the Justice Department and explains
what we must do to prevent this from ever happening again.
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