
Do You Have The Watchlist? Here Are 10
Reasons That Prove It's All a Fraud
It's undeniable - the internet can be a dangerous place. With scams lurking
around every corner, it's crucial to stay vigilant and protect ourselves from falling
victim to fraudulent schemes. One such scheme that has gained quite a
reputation is the infamous Watchlist. Promising unsuspecting individuals a
foolproof way to get rich quick, this so-called secret society claims to offer inside
tips and insights into the stock market. But don't be fooled - here are 10 reasons
that prove the Watchlist is nothing more than a fraudulent operation.

1. Lack of Transparency

Trust is a fundamental aspect of any legitimate business or organization, and the
Watchlist fails miserably at providing transparency. Their website offers limited
information about who runs the operation, what their qualifications are, or how
their so-called insights are obtained. Without this crucial information, it's
impossible to trust their credibility or motives.

2. Unrealistic Promises

We've all heard the saying, "If it sounds too good to be true, it probably is." This
couldn't be more accurate when it comes to the Watchlist. They promise instant
riches and a guaranteed formula to make money effortlessly. But let's face it - the
stock market is volatile and unpredictable. No legitimate entity can guarantee
consistent profits without any risks or losses.
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3. Fake Testimonials

Testimonials can often serve as a powerful tool to convince potential clients of a
business's legitimacy. Unfortunately, the Watchlist takes advantage of this by
posting fake testimonials on their website. These testimonials often feature stock
images or generic names, making it clear that they are fabricated to create an
illusion of satisfied customers.

4. Pushy Sales Tactics

Have you ever felt pressured into making a purchase? That's precisely the
experience you'll have when dealing with the Watchlist. Their sales tactics rely
heavily on fear, scarcity, and urgency. They create a sense of FOMO (fear of
missing out), making it seem like their exclusive membership spots are running
out fast. This high-pressure approach is a telltale sign of a scam.

5. Lack of Verified Results

Any legitimate investment or trading service would proudly showcase their past
results, so potential clients can evaluate their effectiveness. However, the
Watchlist doesn't provide any verified track record of success. They rely solely on
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unsubstantiated claims and empty promises, leaving you in the dark about
whether their tips hold any value at all.

6. No Money-Back Guarantee

Legitimate businesses often provide a money-back guarantee to demonstrate
their confidence in their product or service. The Watchlist, on the other hand,
doesn't offer any such assurance. This lack of a safety net shows a disregard for
customer satisfaction and further raises suspicions about their true intentions.

7. Copycat Website Designs

One clear red flag to look out for is an overly familiar website design. Scammers
often reuse website templates or designs to create a sense of trust and familiarity.
The Watchlist has been known to mimic the designs of other reputable trading
platforms, using this trick to give themselves an air of legitimacy.

8. Negative Customer Reviews

If a business rakes in negative reviews from countless customers, it's definitely a
sign that something fishy is going on. Look around, and you'll find countless
complaints from Watchlist customers who feel scammed and deceived. From
hidden fees to failed strategies, these reviews paint a clear picture of the
Watchlist's true nature.

9. Lack of Regulatory Oversight

Reputable trading platforms and investment services are subject to regulatory
oversight to ensure fair practices and protect consumers. However, the Watchlist
operates without any such oversight. This absence of regulation leaves
customers vulnerable to potential scams, as there are no governing bodies to
hold the Watchlist accountable for their actions.



10. Inconsistent Information

Inconsistencies in their marketing materials, website content, or customer support
can be telling signs of a fraudulent operation. The Watchlist has been found to
frequently contradict themselves, providing misleading information or conflicting
advice. This lack of coherence only further erodes any trust you might have held
in this supposed secret society.

Given these ten reasons, it's evident that the Watchlist is nothing more than a
fraudulent scheme designed to take advantage of unsuspecting individuals. Its
lack of transparency, fake testimonials, and pushy sales tactics should serve as
major warning signs. Don't be lured by the false promises and flashy marketing -
protect your hard-earned money by staying far away from the Watchlist.
Remember, if it seems too good to be true, it probably is.
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The Terrorist Watchlist is supposedly used by the National CounterTerrorism
Center and the FBI to track global "known or suspected terrorists." Unfortunately,
that is a lie. The majority of names on the Watchlist are Targeted Individuals, not
terrorists.
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The first four reasons:

1) In 2012, the State Department did extensive research for each country,
estimating the maximum total number of terrorists worldwide at 184,000. This
same year, the Terrorist Watchlist, run by the FBI claimed nearly 1 million name
records, worldwide. Note that the State Department has thousands of employees
that reside in these foreign countries that have access to the local people, local
events, and local politics. The FBI has very few, if any, employees located in
these countries.

2. How is it possible that the FBI has the names, addresses, driver's license
information, names of family and friends, etc., while the State Department can
only roughly estimate the numbers of "known or suspected" terrorists? The State
Department also has access to the same Watchlist - so why are the numbers very
different? Who is lying and why?

3) Non-Investigative Subject (NIS). The FBI uses the term "Non-Investigative
Subject" for many people listed on the Watchlist as a "known or suspected
terrorist." Why would the FBI claim someone is a "known or supected terrorist"
and then not investigate them? Because most of the names on the Watchlist are
Targeted Individuals, not terrorists.

4) The Department of Justice lied to Federal Judge John Anderson twice,
regarding the number of corporations that were given access to the Terrorist
Watchlist database. The DOJ's latest answer is - about 700 corporations were
given access to the Watchlist. The Watchlist database is supposedly classified
information, and a security clearance is supposedly required to view it.

“To share the private information of citizens and non-citizens with corporations is
illegal and outrageous,” said Attorney, Nihad Awad.
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10 reasons that demonstrate the importance of technology in business


